
 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

VENDOR NAME
DOLESE BROS. CO.

REMARKS 2024 Pricing/F.O.B. PIT
Location:

Item Description:  
1 1/2" #57 ASTM $17.55 no bid

4" ODOT Filter Blanket no bid no bid
1" Crusher Run no bid $10.80

1 1/2" Crusher Run $11.75 $10.25
2 1/2" Crusher Run $11.75 $10.25

Screenings $11.20 $9.70
1 1/2" Flex Base no bid  $12.50

Select Riprap 12" $32.75 AS AVAILABLE AS AVAILABLE $28.75
Select Riprap 18" or More $32.75 AS AVAILABLE AS AVAILABLE $28.75

Non-Spec S.L. Riprap $32.75 no bid
Dry Surge Approx. 6" $13.30 $11.80

Shot Down Rock $12.95 $11.45
Fine Surge Approx. 3" $13.30 $11.80

1 1/2" ODOT Base Type A $13.30 $11.80

VENDOR NAME
Green Dream

REMARKS 2024 Pricing/New
Location:

Item Description:  
Precinct 1

1 1/2" Flex Base $28.20 n/a
4" Ballast Rock $45.12 n/a

Precinct 2
1 1/2" Flex Base $31.80 n/a

4" Ballast Rock $49.15 n/a
Precinct 3

1 1/2" Flex Base $33.00 n/a
4" Ballast Rock $52.32 n/a

Precinct 4
1 1/2" Flex Base $31.80 n/a

4" Ballast Rock $54.05 n/a

Precinct One-Two-Three-Four

2025 Pricing/F.O.B. PIT
COLEMAN QUARRY

Precinct One-Two-Three-Four

2025 Pricing/Delivered per Ton
Austin, TX
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

VENDOR NAME
McCraw Materials     

Location: Telephone Melissa Ambrose
Item Description:  

Mixed Gravel 3/8 - 1 1/2                (Blended 
Dirty Rock) $13.00 n/a n/a $10.00

Dirty Rock 3/4 - 1 1/2 $10.00 n/a $11.00 $11.00
Dirty Oversized Rock 3" n/a n/a n/a $7.00

Clay Balls $7.00 n/a $7.00 $7.00
3/4" Clean Rock                              (Native 

"Washed") $21.00 n/a $17.00 $17.00
Semi-Washed Native 1 1/2" Road 

Gravel  (Blended) $13.00 n/a n/a n/a
Recycle Asphalt n/a $22.00 n/a $20.00

VENDOR NAME
NET Excavation Inc.

2025 Pricing- Bid FOB Pit Bid FOB Barn Bid FOB REMARKS 2024 Pricing/ALL

Per Ton Per Ton Designated

Delivery per 
various 
trucking 

102.8 Location companies
Per Mile  

Item Description:  
Precinct 1

Crushed White Rock $13.00 $22.39 $6.0000 $13 $22.39 $6
3" x 5" Entrance Rock $15.00 $24.50 $6.0000 $15.00 $24.00 $6.00

$95.80 $0 $95.80 $0
Precinct 2

Crushed White Rock $13.00 $23.50 $6.0000 $13 $.35   $6
3" x 5" Entrance Rock $15.00 $25.00 $6.0000 $15.00 $25.00 $6.00

Precinct 3
Crushed White Rock $13.00 $15.60 $6.0000 $13 $15.60 $6

3" x 5" Entrance Rock $15.00 $17.60 $6.0000 $15 $17.60 $6

Precinct One-Two-Three-Four

2025 Pricing/F.O.B. PIT Remarks 2024 Pricing/F.O.B. PIT

Precinct One-Two-Three-Four
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

Precinct 4
Crushed White Rock $13.00 $19.25 $6.0000 $13 $19.25 $6

3" x 5" Entrance Rock $15.00 $21.00 $6.0000 $15 $21 $6

VENDOR NAME
N-TEX Sand & Gravel

Location:
Item Description:  

1 1/2" Clean Rock Minus River Rock $40.00 n/a
Dirty Rock w/Clay $40.00 n/a

VENDOR NAME
P & K STONE, LLC

REMARKS 2024 Pricing/F.O.B. PIT
Location:

Item Description:  
1 1/2 " #57 ASTM $16.00 Mill Creek $16.00

1 1/2"Crusher Run #3 $11.00 Coleman $8.00
Screenings $8.00 Mill Creek $8.00
3/8" Chips $19.50 Mill Creek $20.00
5/8 " Chips $19.50 Mill Creek $20.00

Select Riprap 12" $25.00 Mill Creek $25.00
Select Riprap 18" or More $27.00 Mill Creek $27.00

Road Gravel $15.00 Mill Creek no bid
Railroad Rock 2" ASTM #3 $19.00 Mill Creek $22.00

1 3/4" Crusher Run $11.00 Coleman no bid
Non Spec S.L. Riprap $25.00 Mill Creek no bid
Dry Surge Approx. 6" $20.00 Mill Creek $24.00

1 1/2 " ODOT Base Type A $11.00 Mill Creek $10.00
1 1/2" Clean Rock $15.00 Coleman $20.00

1 1/2" Flex Base $9.00 Mill Creek $8.00
1" Utility Stone $15.00 Mill Creek $15.00

3/8" Screenings $8.00 Mill Creek $8.00
3" x 5" Entrance Rock $16.00 Coleman $23.00

Precinct One-Two-Three-Four

2025 Pricing/F.O.B. PIT Remarks 2024 Pricing/NEW
SAVOY

Precinct One-Two-Three-Four

2025 Pricing/F.O.B. PIT
See Remarks
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

VENDOR NAME
Quality Sand

REMARKS 2024 Pricing/NEW
Location:

Item Description:  
Precinct 1

Masonry Sand $13.75 N/A
Dirty Rock 3/4 - 1 1/2 $16.75 N/A

Semi-Washed Native 1 1/2" Road Gravel $16.75 N/A
Precinct 2

Masonry Sand $15.60 N/A
Dirty Rock 3/4 - 1 1/2 $18.60 N/A

Semi-Washed Native 1 1/2" Road Gravel $18.60 N/A
Precinct 3

Masonry Sand $14.50 N/A
Dirty Rock 3/4 - 1 1/2 $17.50 N/A

Semi-Washed Native 1 1/2" Road Gravel $17.50 N/A
Precinct 4

Masonry Sand $13.00 N/A
Dirty Rock 3/4 - 1 1/2 $16.00 N/A

Semi-Washed Native 1 1/2" Road Gravel $16.00 N/A

See Remarks

Precinct One-Two-Three-Four

2025 Pricing/F.O.B. Barn
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

VENDOR NAME
R.K. Hall

2025 Pricing- Bid FOB Pit Bid FOB Barn Bid FOB REMARKS 2024 Pricing/ALL

Per Ton Per Ton Designated
Price to Location
include Per Mile  

Rock & Hauling  
Item Description:  

  
Precinct One

Crushed Flex Base 13/4" TXDOT#247 $13.00 $33.70 $11.50 $13 $33.70 
1 1/2" #57 ASTM $19.00 $39.70 $19.00 $19 $39.70

1 1/2" Crusher Run 3 Base $12.50 $33.20 $11.00 $12.50 $33.20
1 1/2" Crusher Run Base no bid no bid no bid no bid

1 3/4" Crusher Run $0.00 $33.70
Screenings $8.00 $28.70 $7.50 $8 $28.70

TY B Grade 3 $40.00 $60.70 $38.00 $40 $60.70
TY B Grade 4 $40.00 $60.70 $38.00 $40 $60.70
TY B Grade 5 $35.00 $55.70 $38.00 $35 $55.70

3/8" Chips D-Rock $18.00 $38.70 $18.00 $18 $38.50
3/8" Chips (Ty D) no bid $0.35 no bid no bid

5/8" Chips $20.00 $40.70 $20.00 $20 $40.70
Select Riprap 12" $40.00 $65.20 $35.00 $40 $65.20

Select Riprap 18" or More $40.00 $65.20 $35.00 $40 $65.20
Road Gravel $12.50 $33.20 $11.00 $12.50 $33.20
Ballas Rock $20.00 no bid $20.00 no bid

Dry Surge Approx  3x5 no bid $55.20 $0.23 $.28 $55.20
1 3/4" Quarry Run Base $13.00 $33.70 $11.50 $13 $33.70

Non-Spec SL Riprac $40.00 $65.20 $35.00 $40 $65.20
3/4" Crusher Run $12.00 $32.70 $10.50 $12 $32.70
1 1/2" Flex Base $12.50 $33.20 $11.00 $12.50 $33.20
1" Utility Stone $19.00 $39.70 $19.00 $19 $39.70

3" x 5" Entrance Rock $30.00 $55.20 $25.00 $30 $55.20
1 1/2" ODOT Base Type A $13.00 $32.70 $12 $32.70
3/4" Clean Rock B-Rock $19.00 $39.70 $19.00 $19 $39.70
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

Precinct Two
Crushed Flex Base 1 3/4" TXDOT#247 $13.00 $35.08 $11.50 $13 $35.08

1 1/2" #57 ASTM $19.00 $41.08 $19.00 $19 $41.08
1 1/2" Crusher Run #3 $12.50 $34.58 $11.00 $12.50 $34.58

1 3/4" Crusher Run $13.00 $35.08 $11.50 $13 $35.08
Screenings $8.00 $30.08 $7.50 $8 $30.08

TY B Grade 3 $40.00 $62.08 $38.00 $40 $62.08
TY B Grade 4 $40.00 $62.08 $38.00 $40 $62.08
TY B Grade 5 $35.00 $57.08 $38.00 $35 $57.08

3/8" Chips (Ty D) $18.00 $40.08 $18.00 $18 $40.08
5/8 " Chips $20.00 $42.08 $20.00 $20 $42.08

Select Riprap 12" $40.00 $66.88 $35.00 $40 $66.88
Select Riprap 18" or More $40.00 $66.88 $35.00 $40 $66.88

Ballast Rock $20.00 no bid no bid no bid
Road Gravel $12.50 $34.58 $11.00 $12.50 $34.58

Non-Spec S.L. Riprap $40.00 $66.88 $35.00 $40 $66.88
3/4" Crusher Run $12.00 $34.08 $12 $34.08

Dry Surge Approx 6" 3x5 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Dry Surge Approx  3x5 $30.00 $56.88 $25.00 $30 $56.88

3/4" Clean Rock B-Rack no bid no bid no bid no bid
3/4" Clean Rock $19.00 $41.08 $19.00 $19 $41.08

1" Utility Stone Ty B $19.00 $41.08 $19.00 $19 $41.08
1 3/4" Quarry Run Base $13.00 $35.08 $11.50 $13 $35.08

1 1/2" Flex Base $12.50 $34.58 $11.00 $12.50 $34.58
3" x 5" Entrance Rock $30.00 $56.88 $25.00 $30 $56.88

Precinct Three
Crushed Flex Base 13/4" TXDOT#247 $13.00 $27.95 $11.50 $13 $27.95

1 1/2" #57 ASTM $19.00 $33.95 $19.00 $19 $33.95
Screenings $8.00 $22.95 $7.50 $8 22.95

1 1/2 Crusher Run $12.50 $27.45 $11.00 $12.50 $27.45
1 3/4 Crusher Run $13.00 $27.95 $11.50 $13 $27.95

TY B Grade 3 $40.00 $54.95 $38.00 $40 $54.95
TY B Grade 4 $40.00 $54.95 $38.00 $40 $54.95
TY B Grade 5 $35.00 $49.95 $38.00 $35 $49.95

3/8" Chips (Ty D) $18.00 $32.95 $18.00 $18 $32.95
5/8 Chips $20.00 $34.95 $20.00 $20 $34.95

Select Riprap 12" $40.00 $58.20 $35.00 $40 $58.20
Select Riprap 18" or More $40.00 $58.20 $35.00 $40 $58.20
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

Railroad Rock 2" #4 Ballast $20.00 no bid $20.00 no bid
Road Gravel $12.50 $27.45 $11.00 $12.50 $27.45

1 3/4" Quarry Run Base $13.00 $27.95 $11.50 $13 $27.95
Non-Spec S.L. Riprap $40.00 $58.20 $35.00 $40 $58.20

3/4" Crusher Run $12.00 $26.95 $10.50 $12 $26.95
Dry Surge Approx. 3 x 5 $30.00 $48.20 $25.00 $30 $48.20

Dry Surge Approx 6" no bid no bid no bid no bid
1 1/2" ODOT Base Type A $13.00 $26.95 $12 $26.95

3/4" Clean Rock $19.00 $33.95 $19.00 $19 $33.95
1 1/2" Flex Base $12.50 $27.45 $11.00 $12.50 $27.45

1" Utility Stone Ty B $19.00 $33.95 $19.00 $19 $33.95
3" x 5" Entrance Rock $30.00 $48.20 $25.00 $30 $48.20

Precinct Four
Crushed Flex Base 13/4" TXDOT#247 $13.00 $31.40 $11.50 $13 $31.40

1 1/2" #57 ASTM $19.00 $37.40 $19.00 $19 $37.40
1 1/2" #57 ASTM no bid no bid no bid no bid

1 1/2" Crusher Run #3 $12.50 $30.90 $11.00 $12.50 $30.90
Screenings $8.00 $26.40 $7.50 $8 $26.40

TY B Grade 3 $40.00 $58.40 $38.00 $40 $58.40
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

TY B Grade 4 $40.00 $58.40 $38.00 $40 $58.40
TY B Grade 5 $40.00 $53.40 $38.00 $35 $53.40

3/8 " Chips $18.00 $36.40 $18.00 $18 $36.40
3/8" Chips (Ty D) $18.00 no bid no bid no bid

5/8" Chips $20.00 $38.40 $20.00 $20 $38.40
Select Riprap 12" $40.00 $62.40 $35.00 $40 $62.40

Select Riprap 18" or More $40.00 $62.40 $35.00 $40 $62.40
Railroad Rock 2" #4 Ballast no bid no bid $20.00 no bid

Railroad Rock 2" ASTM #4 Ballast no bid no bid no bid no bid
Road Gravel $12.50 $30.90 no bid $12.50 $30.90

1 3/4" Crusher Run $13.00 $31.40 no bid $13 31.40
1 3/4" Quarry Run Base $13.00 $31.40 $11.50 $13 $31.40
Non-Spec S.L. Riprap $40.00 $62.40 $35.00 $40 $62.40

3/4" Crusher Run $12.00 $30.40 $10.50 $12 $30.40
Dry Surge Approx. 3x5 $30.00 $57.40 $25.00 $30 $57.40

Dry Surge Approx 6" 3x5 no bid no bid no bid no bid
1 1/2:ODOT Base Type A $13.00 $30.40 $12 $30.40
3/4" Clean Rock B-Rock $19.00 $37.40 $19.00 $19 $37.40

1 1/2" Flex Base $12.50 $30.90 $11.00 $12.50 $30.90
1 1/2" Crusher Run Base no bid no bid $11.00 no bid

1" Utility Stone $19.00 $37.40 $19.00 $19 $37.40
3" x 5" Entrance Rock $30.00 $57.40 $25.00 $30 $57.40

VENDOR NAME
SCS Materials/RK Hall Construction

Location:
Item Description:  

1 1/2" Base $12.50 n/a
1 1/2" ODOT Base $12.50 n/a

1 3/4" TxDOT Non-Spec Flex Base $12.00 n/a
1 1/2" Base $12.75 n/a

2" Ballast $14.00 n/a
3 x 5 $14.50 n/a

3/8" Rock $15.00 n/a
5/8" Rock $15.00 n/a

Quarry Waste $10.00 n/a

2024 Pricing/????
Atoka Quarry

2025 Pricing/F.O.B. PIT Remarks

Precinct One-Two-Three-Four
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

River Rock/Road Rock $12.50 n/a
2 1/2 " Crusher Run $12.75

 1 3/4" Quarry Run Base $12.00
1 1/2"ODOT Base Type A $12.50 n/a

3" x 5" Entrance Rock $14.50 n/a

VENDOR NAME
Sun Mining Precinct One-Two-Three-Four

2025 Pricing/F.O.B. PIT Remarks 2024 Pricing/New
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

Location:
Item Description:  

1 1/2" #57 ASTM $14.00 n/a
1 1/2" Crusher Run Base $12.00 n/a

Coleman, OK
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

2 1/2" Crusher Run Base $11.50 n/a
Screenings $9.00 n/a

3/8" Chip $17.50 n/a
Select Riprap 12" $26.50 n/a

Select Riprap 18" or more $26.50 n/a
1 3/4" Clean Rock $14.00 n/a

1 3/4" Crusher Run $11.00
 1 3/4" Quarry Run Base $10.50

3/4" Crusher Run $12.00 n/a
Dry Surge Approx. 6" $12.00

Shot Down Rock $20.00
1 1/2" Clean Rock $14.00

1 1/2" Flex Base $10.00
1" Utility Stone $13.00

3/8" Screenings $8.00

VENDOR NAME
TMS International

Location:
Item Description:  
Slag 89's (1/2 x 0") $9.00 n/a

57's (1"x1/2") $9.00 n/a
304 Blend (1"x0" $9.00 n/a

1's & 2's (3" x 1") $8.00 n/a
Oversize (7" x 3") $4.50 n/a

2025 Pricing/F.O.B. PIT Remarks 2024 Pricing/New
Durant, OK

Precinct One-Two-Three-Four
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

Rock Hauling Only Bids - 2025-005 

VENDOR NAME
Price per Ton 

per Mile Price per Ton per Mile

DM TRUCKING 2025 Pricing 2024 Pricing

Hauling Only - 30 mile minimum
Precinct 1 $0.22 $0.22
Precinct 2 $0.22 $0.22
Precinct 3 $0.22 $0.22
Precinct 4 $0.22 $0.22

VENDOR NAME
Price per Ton 

per Mile Price per Ton per Mile

GLS MATERIALS & TRUCKING 2025 Pricing 2024 Pricing

Hauling Only - 
Precinct 1 $0.23 $0.22
Precinct 2 $0.23 $0.22
Precinct 3 $0.23 $0.22
Precinct 4 $0.23 $0.22

VENDOR NAME
Price per Ton 

per Mile Price per Ton per Mile

RED TOP TRUCKING 2025 Pricing 2024 - N/A NEW

Hauling Only - 
All Precincts
Mixed Gravel 3/8 - 1 1/2 $0.22
Dirty Rock 3/4 - 1 1/2 $0.22
Dirty Oversized Rock 3" $0.22
Clay Balls $0.22
Crushed White Rock $0.22
Crushed Flex Base 2" TXDOT #249 $0.22
1 1/2" #57 ASTM $0.22
4" Special #3 $0.22
1 1/2" Crusher Run #3 $0.22
2 1/2" Crusher Run $0.22
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

Screenings $0.22
TY B Grade 3 $0.22
TY B Grade 4 $0.22
TY B Grade 5 $0.22
3/8" Chips $0.22
5/8" Chips $0.22
Select Riprap 12" $0.25
Select Riprap 18" or More $0.25
Road Gravel $0.22
Railroad Rock 2" ASTM #3 $0.22
1 3/4" Clean Rock $0.22
1 3/4" Crusher Run $0.22
1 3/4" Quarry Run Base $0.22
1 1/2" Class B $0.22
3/4" #1 Cover $0.22
Non-Spec S.L. Riprap $0.22
3/4" Crusher Run $0.22
2" ASTM Size #3 $0.22
Dry Surge Approx. 6" $0.25
Shot Down Rock $0.22
Fine Surge Approx. 3" $0.22
1 1/2" ODOT Base Type A $0.22
Flint Rock $0.22
3/4" Clean Rock $0.22
1 1/2" Clean Rock $0.22
3/8" #2 Cover $0.22
5/8" #3 Cover $0.22
3/8" Hard Road Gravel $0.22
5/8" Hard Road Gravel $0.22
Semi-Washed Native 1 1/2" Road Gravel $0.22
Fly Ash/Flex Base Rock $0.22
1 1/2/" Flex Base $0.22
1" Utility Stone $0.22
3/8" Screenings $0.22
3" x 5" Entrance Rock $0.22
Recycle Asphalt $0.22
Asphalt Dumps N/A
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 2025-2026 ROCK AND GRAVEL BID RECAP RFB 2025-005

VENDOR NAME
Price per Ton 

per Mile Price per Ton per Mile

Texoma Limestone 2025 Pricing 2024 Pricing/No Bid
Everything but 

Rip Rap Rip Rap
Hauling Only - 
Precinct 1 $0.20 $0.22 no bid
Precinct 2 $0.20 $0.22 no bid
Precinct 3 $0.20 $0.22 no bid
Precinct 4 $0.20 $0.22 no bid
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